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It’s competition time! 
The Hockey Association is kicking-off the 
2021/2022 season with a 9 a-side senior 
open division competition which will run 
from October to December 2021.   
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Both our Male and Female teams are 
ready to enjoy hockey and make our 
partners, sponsors and supporters proud. 

 
Youth Competition 
The association’s youth Hockey5s 
competition is due to start after mid-
term.  With over 50 participating 
members in 4 registered Titan’s teams, 
our youth players are anxious to get on 
the field and play. 

 
Membership 
Last year we recorded a total of 62 club 
members. The projected number of 
members for the 2021/2022 season was 
estimated at 120.  It’s only October and 
we have already registered 103 
members. 

 
We are super excited with the interest 
Titans HC is generating in our community 
and the rapid growth the club is 
experiencing.  

 
Senior Women 
Our senior women’s team will be using 
the 9 a-side competition to work on their 
tactical, technical and physical 
preparation for the 11 a-side competition 

scheduled to start after Christmas. 

 
Although we have the youngest team in 
the senior ladies division, we definitely 
give all the other teams a run for their 
money. 
 

New Coach 
The club is delighted to welcome PAUL 
EVANS as coach of the Ladies 1st Division 
team. 

 
Paul has been working with our ladies for 
a few weeks now and we are pleased to 
see how well he has integrated with the 
team.  We are certain he will be an 
important part of a successful season for 
our ladies.  
 

Senior Men 
With 18 senior male members, our men 
are off to a great start with an amazing 
balance of mature experienced players 
and young energetic athletes.  

The men’s team is coached by Kevin 

Casciaro and Steven Soussi who have 
both played top level hockey and are very 
fluent in the coaching element of the 
sport. 

 
Grassroots 
The club has introduced a further weekly 
training session which will be used to 
prepare them for matches and will run 
until December 2021. 

 
In January 2022, we shall have them in 
teams and introduce them to internal 
competition matches.   

 
Junior Leadership Award 
Programme 
Our junior members have shown great 
interest in taking part in this award and 
we are thrilled to see it launched with so 
many participants. 

 
We wish them the best of luck and look 
forward to seeing them successfully 
completing the award. 
 

Recognition  Awards 
We are paying close attention to all our 
members who show potential candidacy 
for the Talent Award, Sportsmanship 
Award and Titan of the Year.   
We are witnessing an amazing level of 
quality in ability, moral skills and devotion 
towards hockey and our club, and we are 
confident our award winners will be truly 
deserving of such recognition. 
 


